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Greece resented the fact that 
F a i l e d established this church. 

« t y , ^ ^ stayed m c ^ a c t ^ t h 

fi^ Ilmothyj ̂ *6i was minister-
^ ^ ^ J B j f - ^Ehff^jG!pans;;: He 

0^1^Jroli^oiis'lbimictis an<f to 
encourage them in their faith. 

ST. ANTHONY CLARET 
' itot^bn^fiGiaret was born in 
Spain in 18071 Although he was 
work ing in J u s family's cloth-
Weaving business, he spent some 
tffv^-time learning Latin and 
studj^gtheartpf^rjfttfogi; 
•̂  Hie eventually entered a semi­
nary and Was ordained a priesjt in 
1835. He had dreams of becoming 
a missionary, but health problems 
prevented him from doing so. He 
worked to spread the Gospel in 
his home country, and he founded 
the Missionary Sons of the 
Immaculate Heart of Mary. 

AfteJFwards, Anthony was given 
the opportunity to become the 
archbishop of Santiago de Cuba, 
and served in the difficult and 
sometimes dangerous position 
until he returned to Spain to 
become confessor to Queen Isa­
bella II. As a scholar, Anthony 
wrote about music, language and 
history- We remember him on 
Oct 24. 
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Paul had established a new Chris­
tian church in Thessalonica, 
Greece, but there were some Jews 
there who were angry because of it. 
In order to escape the danger of 
their wrath, Paul left the city at 
night, when no one would see him. 
He was still concerned about his 
friends, so he sent Timothy to help 
them and -to report back to him. 
When Timothy returned and told 
Paul of the situation in Thessaloni­
ca, Paul thought it would be helpful 
if he wrote a letter to the people in 
the church. 

Paul looked over the report Tim­
othy had written, as well as his own 
notes. Then he began writing. 

"To the church of the Thessaloni­
ans: grace to you and peace. Sil-
vanus, Timothy and I give thanks to 
God always for all of you. You be­
came imitators of the Lord, with joy 
from the Holy Spirit, so that you be­
came a model for all the believers 
in Macedonia. Our reception among 
you was not without effect. Rather, 
after we had suffered and had been 
insolently treated in Philippi, we 
drew courage through our God to 
speak to you the Gospel." 

Paul stopped writing and stared 
out the window. He remembered 
the struggles in Philippi and the 
anger of some of the people in Thes­
salonica. As he thought, he tapped 
his finger on the table, as if he were 
listening to music. He stopped tap­
ping, nodded his head as if agreeing 
with someone and began writing 
again. 

"We were gentle among you, as a 
mother cares for her children. With 
such affection for you, we were de­
termined to share with you not on-
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School. In answer to "How many sacraments are there inthe church?" she 
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ly the Gospel of God, but ourselves 
as well, so dearly beloved had you 
become to lis. Working night and 
day in order not to burden any of 
you, we proclaimed to you the 
Gospel of God. We treated each one 
of you as a father t reats his chil­
dren, exhorting and encouraging 
you and insisting that you conduct 
yourselves as worthy of the God 
who calls you into his kingdom and 
glory." 

Paul read over what he had just 
written to be sure he had expressed 
himself exactly as he had intended 
to. He knew if his words were mis­
understood, someone might be of­
fended or he might accidentally 
cause some confusion within the 
Christian community in Thessa­
lonica. Paul wanted his friends to 

understand that any good they had 
done while they were with them 
was because of the love and power 
of God, not because of anything 
they themselves were able to do. He 
continued writing. 

"Be at peace among yourselves. 
Cheer the fainthearted, support the 
weak, be patient with all. Rejoice al­
ways. Pray without ceasing. Pray 
for us." 

READ MORE ABOUT IT: 
1 Thessalonians 

Q&A 
1. Why did Paul have to leave Thes­

salonica? 
2. What did Paul tell the Thessalo­

nians to do? 
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