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Theologian: Make campuses more Catholic 
By Jerry Filteau 
Catholic News Service 

WASHINGTON - The 
Catholic character of a Catholic 
university ought to be a perva­
sive, palpable part-of campus life, 
according to theologian Monika 
K. Helhvig. 

She expressed concern that 
younger Catholic scholars in the 
sciences, social sciences and hu­
manities lack the necessary for­
mation in their Catholic heritage 
to contribute effectively to a 
much-needed dialogue of 
Catholic theology with culture. 

A university's Catholic identity 
should come through clearly not 
only in its academic program or 
theology curriculum, but in the 
whole "shape of life on a 
Catholic campus," she said. 

Hellwig, a professor of theolo­
gy at Georgetown University, 
spoke at The Cadiolic University 
of America Feb. 22 on the future 
of Catholic universities in light of 
the 1990 papal document Ex 
Corde Ecclesiae on Cadiolic high­
er education. 

Important elements of 
Catholic identity on campus, she 
said, include: 

• "Visible worship ... worship 
that is clearly recognizable as 
part of die life of die university." 

• "The internal life of die (uni­
versity) calendar ... diat the cal­
endar ought to assert patterns of 
the church's year." 

• "The architectural composi­
tion of die campus, that its focus 
should be toward a place of wor­
ship." 

• "A strong sense of commu­
nity, sharing, belonging." 

While she focused most of her 
talk on die academic, intellectu­
al and cultural challenges facing 
Catholic institutions of higher 
learning today, Hellwig said 
diose odier elements also need 
emphasis. 

"The whole character of the 
institution is conveyed sublimi-
naUy to everybody who works in 
it and everybody who comes to it 
by- diese kinds of constitutive fac­
tors," she said. "The very pattern 
of a university in its spacial, tem­
poral and associational aspects 
ought to be a public witness to its 
particular character as a Cadiolic 
university." 

A Catholic campus ought to 
have a strong communal charac­
ter, she said, "because I dunk it is 
of die essence of die Good News 
diat die many dungs that divide 
us and make our lives problem­
atic can be overcome, and I think 
it is of the essence of the partic­
ular Cadiolic padi of Christiani­
ty to emphasize the communal, 
corporate dimension of die Re­
demption and of Christian life." 

In terms of the intellectual life 
of a Catholic university, she 
stressed its role in "exploring 
Catholic culture" and "the gath­
ering of the resources from the 
past for a Catholic culture." 

It ought to be a place where 

diose who want to gain access to 
Cadiolic culture can find the re­
sources and tools to do so, she 
said. 

"A student who comes to a 
Catholic university to study any­
thing whatsoever ought to be­
come more knowledgeable, 
more sophisticated, more inde­
pendent and more critically 
aware of that student's own 
faidi," she said. 

"It would be a sad thing," she 
added, "for Catholic students, 
students with a Catholic family 
background, to come to a 
Catholic university and leave it 
with '.he same naive, childhood 
perception of the faith, usually 
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including lots of prejudicial, su­
perstitious and simply ignorant 
ideas. It would be an appalling 
thing." 

She acknowledged that 
Cadiolic colleges and universities 
must do a better job in that area. 

After the Second Vatican 
Council, she said, "I think a lot of 
the theology departments in un­
dergraduate programs became a 
little embarrassed about the reg­
imented program they had be­
fore and about the fact it might 
have been catechetical — and cat­
echetical possibly in a rather 

dominating way." . 
Many responded by shifting 

from a single, required core-reli­
gious curriculum to offering stu­
dents a choice among numerous 
courses — "various approaches to 
the treasury of the tradition" — 
widi die idea students had differ­
ent needs and each should find 
his or her own best way, she said. 

But she found that inadequate. 
"I would like to make a plea," 

she said, "diat we aren't only ac­
countable to die student, diat in 
the conduct of a Catholic uni­
versity we are accountable to die 
church and the tradition, ac­
countable to hand on die tradi­
tion, accountable to explore the 
tradition, accountable to provide 
an intelligent — faithfully intelli­
gent, intelligendy faithful, intelli­
gent in the faith — Catholic lay 
leadership." 

She said one of the things 
Pope John Paul II stressed in Ex 
Corde Ecclesiae was the need for 
"an encounter of serious theo­
logical thought" with the ways of 
thinking that emerge from the 
sciences and "our increasingly 
mechanized, automated, techno­
logical society." 

But she said increasingly she 
finds that nearly all the scientists 
and scholars in other fields on 
campus able to carry on that se­
rious dialogue with theology 
"have recently retired or are go­
ing to retire very soon. The 
younger scholars coming up in 
those fields don't have that 
breadth, don't have diat sense of 
die intellectual heritage of their 
own religious tradition." 

During a question-answer ses­
sion following her talk, Hellwig 
praised die work of die U.S. bish­
ops' committee that is develop­
ing the U.S. implementation of 
Ex Corde Ecclesiae. 

She said she hopes that the 
committee's implementation 
proposals, introduced to the 
bishops at their general meeting 
last November and strongly en­
dorsed by Cardinal James A. 
Hickey of Washington, will be 
adopted by the bishops. A vote 
on a final version of the propos­
als is expected at the bishops' 
meeting this coming November. 

Take the Bonaventure journey... 
Join us for one of our 
admissions programs this fall. 

OPEN HOUSE 
Sunday, Oct. 6 • Saturdays, Oct 19 and Nov. 9 

BONA BUS TOUR 
Monday, Nov. 11 
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Cantor 
Offering courses for unretired minds 

• Great Books Discussion • Dante's "Love Stories" 
• Italian Pentagram, Part III • Creative Writing 

• Fmanda! Tips for Surviving Spouses • Tune-up French (Intermediate) 

• Telling Your Story: Write Your Life • Between Testaments.-me Judaic Canon 

•-German Conversation • Great Decisions 1996 

These non-credit courses begin the week of September 23. 
All classes meet during the day on the Nazareth College campus. 

Other noihcredit courses are available. 

A brochure and maiMn registration form may be obtained 
by visiting or calling the Office of Continuing Education 

at (716) 3 8 9 - 2 0 5 0 . 
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