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Activists disrupt cardinal's Mass 
By Tracy Early 
Catholic News Service 

NEW YORK — Dozens of people 
protesting Cardinal John J. O'Connor's 
views on homosexuality and abortion tried 
to shout him down during his Sunday 
morning Mass at New York's St. Patrick's 
Cathedral Dec. 10, while a thousand or 
more activists protested outside., 

A smaller number, also outside, demon­
strated in support of the cardinal and 
against "militant anti-Catholic bigotry and 
suppression." Police kept die two groups 
separated. 

As police entered the cathedral to arrest 
and remove demonstrators standing and 
shouting or lying down in the aisles, Car­
dinal O'Connor stopped his homily and 
had die congregation stand to join in the 
Lord's Prayer and recitation of me rosary. 

He then proceeded with the Eucharist, 
despite more protesters rising to shout as 
the first batch was removed. 

A police spokesman later reported that a 
total of 43 arrests were made in the cathe­
dral. In addition, he said, 68 people who 
sought to block me street were arrested. 
According to the spokesman, the demon­
strators were charged with disorderly con-

Los Angeles churches vandalized 
WASHINGTON (CNS) — Protesters 

vandalized four Los Angeles churches with 
paint and posters accusing Los Angeles 
Archbishop Roger M. Mahony of being a 
"murderer" for his opposition to condom 
use, a position me protesters said helps 
spread AIDS. 

In a Dec. 4 statement, Archbishop Ma­
hony said it was "both sad and ironic that 
those who will not accept God's revelation 
as taught faithfully by the Catholic Church 
with respect to human sexuality would at­
tack God's houses.'' 

He said neither he nor me archdiocese 
"will be intimidated by threats or attacks 
against proclaiming the truth as God has 
taught us" and that the church will "pray 
for a change of heart among all peoples.' 

Protesters splattered red paint on the 
steps and doorways and hung posters with 
pictures of the archbishop on me properties 
of St. Basil, Immaculate Conception, St. 

Ambrose and St. Charles churches. The 
demonstrators said die red paint symbo­
lized me blood of all who have died of 
AIDS. 

Archdiocesan spokesman Bill Rivera 
told Catholic News Service Dec. 4 that 
above me archbishop's picture protesters 
had written me words, "Safe sex is a lie 
and a fraud." 

"Underneath his picture, me word 
'murderer' was written in large letters," 
Rivera added. 

Rivera said a group calling itself Greater 
Religious Responsibility has claimed re­
sponsibility for the attacks. Rivera said the 
group believes the U.S. bishops "commit­
ted an immoral act" by opposing efforts to 
promote condom use as a means of combat­
ting me sexual transmission of AIDS. 

Rivera said no arrests had been made in 
the attacks. 
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duct, trespassing and resisting arrest. 
The demonstration was sponsored by the 

AIDS Coalition to Unleash Power, a group 
"united in anger and committed to direct 
action to end the AIDS crisis," and the 
Women's Health Action Mobilization, 
which is devoted to "demanding, securing 
and defending absolute reproductive free­
dom and quality health care for all 
women." 

Both groups are well known to police for 
past disruptive actions that have led to 
arrests. The AIDS group temporarily dis­
rupted a lecture in January 1988 by Car­
dinal Joseph Ratzinger, prefect of the Vati­
can Congregation for the Doctrine of the 
Faith. 

Plans for the action at St. Patrick's Cath­
edral had been widely publicized for 
several weeks, enabling the cathedral and 
the police to plan. 

With Police Commissioner Richard J. 
Condon on hand, uniformed police sur­
rounded the cathedral, and dozens of 
ushers and plainclothes officers watched 
inside. More clergy than usual were in the 
sanctuary, and some of the front pews were 
filled with archdiocesan staff and others 
who might be needed to guard the altar 
area from intruders. 

Reception of Communion proceeded 
"with only minor variations from standard 
procedure, although Cardinal O'Connor 
did not come down as usual to participate 
in distribution. 

There was a report of at least one dese­
cration of a host. According to an observer 
who was nearby, a young man received the 
Eucharist from a priest at the head of the 
center aisle, broke it, threw it on the floor 
and stepped on it. Another priest was then 
summoned, and came and picked up the 
pieces and took them away. The young 

AP 
VICTORY — Banned from Com­
munion by San Diego's bishop 
for her pro-choice views, Lucy 
Killea celebrates her Dec. 6 vic­
tory in a state senate race. 

man walked away without further incident. 
Mayor Edward Koch, who has had legal 

as well as philosophical battles with Car­
dinal O'Connor over homosexual rights, 
sat in a front pew during the Mass in a 
show of support for the cardinal and joined 
him afterward in talking with reporters. 
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