
Personal reflections 

By MARY WEST 
Can there be a just war? Can the con­

ditions laid down by St. Thomas ever be 
fulfilled? What does God want me to 
do? And what am I capable of doing? 
Can I stand out against state and 
Church? Is it pride, presumption, to 
think I have the spiritual capacity to use 
spiritual weapons in the face of the most 
gigantic tyranny the world has ever 
seen? Am I capable of enduring suffer­
ing, facing martyrdom? And alone? 

Again the long loneliness to be faced. 
(Dorothy Day, The Long Loneliness) 

So novel, so different, so unique was 
the Catholic Worker tradition of Gospel 
non-violence and direct action that, 
throughout most of its history, the move­
ment's founders as well as its followers 
were considered alien and suspect by 
country and church. 

Relying principally on the words of Je­
sus, Dorothy Day had espoused paci­
fism since the earliest publication of the 
Catholic Worker newspaper, through the 
tumult of class war, race war, the 
Ethiopian War, the Spanish Civil War, 
World War II and the Korean war. Al­
though relentlessly courteous and loyal 
in describing her relationship with the 
Church hierarchy in general and the New 
York chancery in particular, Dorothy 
nonetheless acknowledged that even 
the bishops who supported her work 
with the poor and with trade unions did 
not agree with her on non-violence. 
(Some bishops refused altogether to 
have Catholic Worker houses in their 
dioceses.) 

In her own city, she repeatedly made 
it clear that the New York Chancery had 
given the Catholic Worker freedom in its 
efforts to inform the consciences of its 
readers; in fact, two Catholic Worker 
pamphlets entitled "The Weapons of the 
Spirit" and "The Gospel of Peace" car­
ried the "imprimatur" of the New York 
Archdiocese. 

Dorothy Day 

For developing and living out a doct­
rine that was a clear departure from the 
Just-War theory, she relied on her own 
reading of the Gospel for inspiration, 
and her Catholic Worker associates like 
Ammon Hennacy for companionship 
and support. 

She saw political issues in light of her 
Christian non-violence. Her solution to 
the advent of the cold war arms race 
was starkly simple: 

"...destroy the two billion dollars 
worth of equipment that was built up to 
make the atomic bomb; destroy all the 
formulas, put on sack cloth and ashes, 
weep and mourn. And God will not for­
get to Show mercy." 

Then in the 1960s came a sign of 
hope and encouragement. The last ses­
sion of the Second Vatican Council took 
up the issue of modern warfare as part 
of its document on the Church in the 

Modern World. 
Dorothy Day, (then 68), along with a 

score of other women, made a pilgrim­
age to Rome; and there fasted and 
prayed that the bishops would issue a 
strong statement against nuclear war­
fare and in support of conscientious ob­
jection. For Dorothy, the document 
passed by the Council was "happy news 
... (the) statement for which we had 
been working and praying." 

One can imagine Dorothy joining oth­
ers in prayer for the U.S. bishops as they 
developed their pastoral letter on peace. 
Certainly her example influenced the 
section on non-violence, as the letter it­
self notes. The bishops' pastoral letter 
reaffirms the Council's support for non­
violence as a valid Christian lifestyle. 

We can hope that the way of non-vio­
lence might be less lonely for us than for 
Dorothy. 

By ANGELA CERNA-PLATA, IHM 
As people of faith and as people con­

fronted with the evil of nuclear war, we 
cannot lose our hope in the promises of 
peace that our Lord gave to us. Now, 
more than any time in bur history, we 
have to strengthen our faith through 
prayer. 

Peace has to start in our everyday life. 
This is what the signs of our times call us 
to: To be persons of prayer, asking God 
to help us realize the gift of peace that 
Jesus left us. 

In their pastoral letter the bishops en­
courage various forms of prayer for 
peace. They direct attention to the sac­
rament of reconciliation and communal 
penance services and especially to the 
Mass. They also encourage the reading 
of Scripture and the praying of the Ro­
sary. They call upon all of us to make 
our sign of peace at Mass an authentic 
sign of our peace with God and with one 
another. 

We also have to remember that our 
prayer will be incomplete if it is not ac­
companied by sacrifices and penance. 
Such penance enables us to make re­
paration for the violence in our own lives 
and the violence in the world. 

As an example of what such penance 
can involve, the bishops focus upon the 

day Friday. They commit themselves to 
fast and abstain on Friday and ask us all 
to eat less food and abstain from meat 
on that day. 

Because, in one way or another, we 
are all capable of violence and injustice, 
we are always in need of conversion. By 
taking advantage of opportunities for 
prayer and penance — on Fridays but 
not only on Fridays — we can become 
more strongly committed to move in the 
direction of a peaceful world. 

We Hispanics are known as religious 
people. Prayer and sacrifice are part of 
our everyday life. It comes naturally to 
us and we now have the duty to channel 
those special gifts toward the challenge 
of peace that is threatening our world. 
Our prayer, fast and abstinence are 
needed today together with the offering 
of ourselves toward the service of others 
in our neighborhoods and our communi­
ties and in that way to embrace and 
build a world of peace 


