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laypersons who became members of his Third Order were not 
"to take up lethal weapons, or bear them about, against any­
body." 

The vision of Christian non-violence is not passive about in­
justice and the defense of the rights of others; it rather affirms 
and exemplifies what it means to resist unjustice through non­
violent methods. 

In the 20th century, prescinding from the non-Christian wit­
ness of a Mahatma Gandhi and its Worldwide impact, the non­
violent witness of such figures as Dorothy Day and Martin 
Luther King has had a profound impact upon the life of the 
church in the United States. The witness of numerous Chris­
tians who had preceded them over the centuries was affirmed in 
a remarkable way at the Second Vatican Council. 

Two of the passages which were included in the final version 
of the pastoral constitution gave^ particular encouragement for 
Catholics in all walks of life to assess their attitudes toward war 
and military service in the light of Christian pacifism. In Para­
graph 79 the council fathers called upon governments to enact 
laws protecting the rights of those who adopted the position of 
conscientious objection to all war: "Moreover, it seems right 
that laws make humane provisions for the case of those who for 
reasons of conscience refuse to bear arms, provided, however, 
that they accept some other form of service to the human com­
munity." (49) This was the first time a call'for legal protection 
of conscientious objectors had appeared in a document of such 
prominence. In addition to its own profound meaning this state­
ment took on even more significance in light of the praise that 
the council fathers had given in the preceding section "to those 
who renounce the use of violence in the vindication of their 
rights." (50) In "Human Life in Our Day" (1968) we called for 
legislative provision to recognize selective conscientious objec­
tors as well. (51) 

As Catholic bishops it is incumbent upon us to stress to our 
"own community and to the wider society the significance of this 
support for a pacifist option for-individuals in the teaching of 
Vatican II and the reaffirmation that the popes have given to 
non-violent witness since the time of the council. 

In the development of a theology of peace and the growth of 
the Christian pacifist position among Catholics, these words of 
the pastoral constitution have special significance: "All these 
factors force us to undertake a completely fresh reappraisal of 
war." (52) The council fathers had reference to "the develop­
ment of armaments by modern science (which) has immeasur­
ably magnified the horrors and wickedness of war." (53) While 
the just-war teaching has clearly been in possession for the past 
1.500 years of Catholic thought, the "new moment" in which we 
find ourselves sees the just-war teaching and non-violence as 
distinct but interdependent methods of evaluating warfare. 
They diverge on some specific conclusions, but they share a 
common presumption against ¥fee use of force as a means of 
settling disputes. 

Both find their roots in the Christian theological tradition; 
each contributes to the full moral vision we need in pursuit of a 
human peace. We believe the two perspectives support and com­
plement one another, each preserving the other from distortion. 
Finally, in an age of technological warfare, analysis from the 
viewpoint of non-violence and analysis from the viewpoint of 
the just-war teaching often converge and agree in their opposi­
tion to methods of warfare which are in fact indistinguishable 
from total warfare. 

11/̂  War and Peace in the Modern 
World: Problems and Principles 

Both the just-war teaching and non-violence are confronted 
with a unique challenge by nuclear warfare. This must be the 
starting point of any further moral-reflection: Nuclear weapons 
particularly and nuclear warfare as it is planned today raise 
new moral questions. No previously conceived moral position 
escapes the fundamental confrontation posed by contemporary 
nuclear strategy. Many have noted the similarity of the state­
ments made by eminent scientists and Vatican II's observation 
that we are forced today "to undertake a completely fresh reap­
praisal of war." The task before us is not simply to repeat what 
we have said before; it is first to consider anew whether and 
how our religious-moral tradition can assess, direct, contain 
and, we hope, help to eliminate the threat posed to the human 
family by the nuclear arsenals of the world. Pope John Paul II 
captured the essence of the problem during his pilgrimage to 
Hiroshima: "In the pasjt it was possible to destroy a village, a 
town, a region, even a country. Now it is the world planet that 
has come under threat." (54) 

The Holy Father's observation illustrates why the moral 
problem is also a religious question of the most profound signifi­
cance. In the nuclear arsenals of the United States or the Soviet 
Union alone thfere exists a capacity to do something no other 

age'couftilinage: We can threaten the entire planet. (55) For 
people of faith this means we read the Book of Genesis with a 
new awareness; the moral issue at stake in nuclear war involves 
the meaning of sin in its most graphic dimensions. Every sinful 
act is a confrontation of the creature and the Creator. Today 
the destructive potential of the nuclear powers threatens the 
human person, the civilization we have slowly constructed, and 
even the created order itself. 
v We live today, therefore, in the midst of a cosmic drama; we 
possess a power which should never be used, but which might 
be used if we do not reverse our direction. We live with nuclear 
weapons knowing we cannot afford one serious mistake. This 
fact dramatizes the precariousness of our position, politically, 
morally and spiritually. 

A prominent "sign of the times" today is a sharply increased 
awareness of the danger of the nuclear arms race. Such aware­
ness has produced a public discussion about nuclear policy here 
and in othafr countries which is unprecedented in its scope and 
depth. What has been accepted for years with almost no ques­
tion is now being subjected to the sharpest criticism. What 
previously had been defined as a safe and stable system of 
deterrence is today viewed with political and moral skepticism. 
Many forces are at work in this new evaluation, and we believe 
one of the crucial elements is the gospel vision of peace which 
guides our work in this pastoral letter. The nuclear age has been 
the theater of our existence for almost four decades; today it is 
being evaluated with a new perspective. For many the leaven of 
the Gospel and the light of the Holy Spirit create the decisive 
dimension of this new perspective. 

A. The New Moment 
At the center of the new evaluation of the nuclear arms race 

is a recognition of two elements: the destructive potential of 
nuclear Weapons and the stringent choices which the nuclear 
age poses for both politics and morals. 

The fateful passage into the nuclear age as a military reality 
began with the bombing of Nagasaki and Hiroshima, events 
described by Pope Paul VI as a "butchery of untold magni­
tude." (56) Since then, in spite of effort^ at control and plans 
for disarmament (e.g., the Baruch Plan of 1946), the nuclear 
arsenals have escalated, particularly in the two superpowers. 
The qualitative superiority of these two states, however, should 
not overshadow the fact that four other countries possess nucle­
ar capacity and a score of states are only steps away from 
becoming "nuclear nations." 

This nuclear escalation has been opposed sporadically and 
selectively, but never effectively. The race has continued in 
spite of carefully expressed doubts by analysts and other citi­
zens and in the face of forcefully expressed opposition by public 
rallies. Today the opposition to the arms race is no longer selec­
tive or sporadic, it is widespread and sustained. The danger and 
destructiveness of nuclear weapons are understood and resisted 
with new urgency and intensity. There is in the public debate 
today an endorsement of the position submitted by the Holy 
See at the United Nations in 1976: The arms race is to be 
condemned as a danger, an act of aggression against the poor, 
and a folly which does not provide the security it promises. 
(57) 

Papal teaching has consistently addressed the folly and dan­
ger of the arms race; but the.new.perception of it which is now 
held by the general public is due in large measure to the work of 
scientists and physicians who have described for citizens the 
concrete human consequences of a nuclear war. (58) \ 

In a striking demonstration of his personal and pastoral con­
cern for preventing nuclear war, Pope John Paul II commis­
sioned a study by the Pontifical Academy of Sciences which 
reinforced the findings of other scientific bodies. The Holy Fa­
ther had the study transmitted by personal representative to 
the leaders of the United States, the Soviet Union, the United 
Kingdom and France, and to the president of the General As­
sembly of the United Nations. One of its conclusions is especial­
ly pertinent to the public debate in the United States: 

"Recent Ibalk about winning or even surviving a nuclear war 
must reflect a failure to appreciate a medical reality: Any nucle­
ar war would inevitably cause death, disease and suffering of 
pandemonicrproportions and without the possibility of effective 
medical intervention. That reality leads to the same conclusion 
physicians have reached for life-threatening epidemics through­
out histor^. Prevention is essential for control." (59) 

This medical conclusion has a moral corollary. Traditionally 
the church's moral teaching sought first to prevent war and 
then to limit its consequences if it occurred. Today the possibili­
ties for placing political and moral limits on nuclear war are so 
minimal that the moral task, like the medical, is prevention: As 
a people, we must refuse to legitimate the idea of nuclear war. 
Such a refusal will require not only new ideas and new vision, 
but what the Gospel calls conversion of the heart. 

To say no to nuclear war is both a necessary and a complex 


