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Sometime when you think of 
Jer iy Ford as president for four 
raor^ years, remember the 
Barry Goldwater remark' about 
sawing off the northeast and 
letting i t fallJ into ̂  the Atlantic 
That's what, this election is 
really all about If Ford wins, 
the northeast is gone and so are^ 
Catholics, since they are the 
largest population group of the 
region, Jljn Miller, The Tablet, 
Septi 2, l&fr.- * >. - ^ 
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Secretary rof Agriculture Earl 
Butz has~ been fired for a~slur 
against blacks You'll 
remember he was not fired for 
a* similar slur against 
Catiol ics . Tablet Editorial 
J$oV 
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2, 1976. 

I am appalled a t the 
misrepresentation of Governor 
Car ter ' s position on issues 
important to Catholics such as 
aid to parochial schools and the 
taxation of church property. 
Governor Carter strongly 
favors aid to parochial schools 
.and opposes any plan to tax 
church property Sec* of State 
Mario Cuomo Oct. 17, 1976. 

On mors* thaw A half-dozen Key 
issues - the" economy, unem­
ployment^ a guaranteed in­
come, healthcare for example-
the ^ Democrat ic Piatform 
agrees withjthe United States 
Catholic Conference and the 
Republican Platform does not 
National Catholic News Ser­

v ice , Sepfcr 24, 1976. v~rJv J c Jl-

We need leadership again that 
will mstdl respect for-.our in­
stitutions and for each other-.;-s 
and make every American 
aware that a slur against any 
ethnic minority- - is a slur 
against us a 1 If ever a member 
of my Cabinet uttered a .racial 
slur a contemptuous joke 
against Italian or Blacks or 
Poles- - 1 wouldn't wait for the 
public i reaction. I wouldnlt 
reprimand him. I'd f.irefiinl-On 
the spot Gov Carter, Chicago, 
Oc#.JUU 1976 
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CATHO^ICJEl^0t! j |^O&r: 6, l^ fo 

..v>r,-
| t is clear that the national 
government should have^ a 
stroig pro-iamdy policy, but 
theiact is that our government 
lias ho family policy, and that is 
the jsame^ thing AS an anti-
famliijr^ policy" -Because of 
confusion or-msensitivity.-dur 
'govern%e^ft^*|>oJteifS -MVe' 
oftei actually weakened" din* 
families,* or i even destroyed 
them. Vie need a .government 
that! thinks about the American 
famjily and caresr about' the 
American family and makes its 
every decision with the intent of 
strengthening the family. 
Remarks by Jimmy Carter on 
the]American Family '- Man­
chester, N.H. Aug^ 3,1976. 

Neighborhoods and families 
are! the, living fiber that-holds 
our society together. Until we 
place them^at the very top of 
our 
tor 

national'policy, our Tiopes 
the nation, and our goals for 

our private 'lives, will not be 
attained. Gov. Carter, Brooklyn 
College,JSeptf6, 1976. ' 
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Instead of denouncing Jimmy 
Carter we should encourage 
him For ifs he keeps his 
promise it will be a 
monumental advance over 
what President Ford has done 

-regarding 'abortion Whereas 
Jimmy Carter has promised.-

„4T11 do all, I can within the 
framework of the .Supreme 
Court decision to hold down the 
number of abortions. I »don't 
think governments ought to 
spend any money to finance 
abortion " Msgr . Salvatore 
Adamo, editor, Catholic Star 
Herald, Diocese of Camden, 

By: the honest and openf"way 
with which he has gone into the 
•ethnic neighborhoods off big 
American cities to„ listen and 
learn, Carter may have,set up a 
resonance with the people who 
live m these neighborhoods 
Such skills show a g r ea t 
political adroitness More than 
that, they also show a gifted 
human being Andrew Greeley, 
N. Y. Daily News'Oct. 5, 1976. 

Jimmy par ter told CathdMc 
social workers that he fa^Ofed-
aia to' parents where children 
attend[ non-segregated private 

.schools Richard Tucker, The 
Deaver Catholic Register, Oct. 
6, 1976T 
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