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"What? M e serve with them?" 

"You're kidding!" 

The breaking oi tradition by 
the girls of St. Monica's Parish 
brought groans and short lived 
protests from their male con-

' temporaries as skirts began to 
flash under long red cassocks. St. 
Monica's, the -first in the diocese, 
has altar girls. 

It began in September of last 
year with a discussion of Pope 
Paul Vl's decree barring women 
from any kind of formal role in 
the ministry of the Church. One 

. . female member of the seventh 
and eighth grade religion class 
promptly suggested the idea of 
having girls serve on the altar. 
The idea snowballed and the girls' 
enthusiasm caught fire; 

"We were going to fight for it 
and even protest in front of the 

. Church if they didn't let us, said 
Linda Pugliese, an eighth grader. 

Such fanfare wasn't necessary 
as Richard Ensman, director of 
Mass servers and a member of St. 
Monica's staff decided with the 
parish priests, "if they stuck it 
through the program and were 
really interested, the>i they could 
become altar girls." 

The "program" is the two-
month training course held every 
Fall; nine girls in the seventh and 
eighth grades completed their 
training to join the ranks of the 
Mass servers.jSt Monica's was 
used --to -female participation 

.since Sister Barbara M o o r e , 

pastoral assistant already had 
been preaching the homily and 
distributing. Communion. 

"The only negative feedback 

Join A Iter Boys at St. Monica 
was from the boys themselves, 
but no one refused to serve'with 
them/' Ensman said. Traditionally 
the Church has had only male 
servers; "You can see how this 
idea has been really engrained in 
the kids," he said. 

. Altar boys as an institution 

To The Fair 

Eleanor CrabensteUer, coming 
through doorway, was .anxious 
ia mi s k r i e d for the M u M M 
County Fair. She is a member of 
the senior citizens group affilia­
t e d w i t h Charles Set t lement 
h o w e Which made an afternoon 
excursion to the fair grounds 

Aug. 18. 
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Some people think it 
is an anachronism 
but I feel it is an 

opportunity to ac­

quaint the kids with 

the Church commu­
nity. In this way 

, they are given a 
special place in 
the Church/ 
came into existence around the 
rise of the Industrial Revolution. 
"Men were not available to serve 
Mass so young boys were used. 
Altar boys as well as the idea of 
parochial schools emerged about 
the same time," said the young 
director. In 1937 the Knights of 
the Altar deve loped as an 
organization of individual altar 
boy units and set up a standard 
program. It came under the 
auspices of the Holy Cross 
Fathers of Notre Dame ip 1948, 
with headquarters in Marseilles,^ 
in. 

Ensman explained that like the 
Boys Scouts, the Knights of the 
Altar had codes, and ad­
vancement tests. A boy would 
start out as an apprentice and 
then work up to the rank of page, 
scjuire, lord and so on modeled 
after the hierarchy established in 
the feudal systems.. 

"With the new liturgf in the 
196CS, the role of the altar boy 
began to diminish. A lot of the 
rote functions he used to perform 
no longer existed as the 
congregation began to par­
ticipate more," Ensman said. The 
Knights of the Altar still operate 
out of a small parish but "for all 
practical purposes they are 
inactive." 

The focus of a t ten t ion , 
maintained Ensman, should not 
be on the novel idea of having 
altar girls but on the question of 

what Is the fole of a Mass server. 
"Some people think it is an 
anachronism but I feel it is an 
opportunity to acquaint the kids 
with the Church community. In 
this way they are given a special 
place in the Church," he said. 

Jul ie W e b s t e r [ r i g h t ] a n d L i n d a P u g l i e s e k n e e l i n f r o n t o f 
ro les as t h e f i rst d i o c e s a n a l t a r gir ls a t St 

St. Monica's is attempting to 
integrate "the experience^on the 
altar with the experiences off the 
altar," Ensman explained. The 
servers do not only' assist at the 
Mass but run special projects on 
their own initiative. A carnival for 
the muscular c dystrophy cam­
paign netted $100. In December 
the servers w e n t Christmas 
caroling.. 

Ensman sees the use of altar 
boys and girls as "a real potential 
for reaching the kids of the 
Church. They are not just told" 
how to serve Mass but why they 
are serving and what each step 

Bishop Minihan 
Dies in Ireland 

Dublin [RNS] - Auxiliary 
Bishop Jeremiah F. Minihan of 
Boston died suddenly August 14 
while on vacation here visiting 
relatives. Re was 70 years old. 

A Mass of the Resurrection was 
held at the Cathedral of Holy 
gyss in Boston on August 18r 

with burial in Haverhill, Mass. 

Bishop Minihan's parents were 
natives of Ireland, and he was 
prominent in Ir ish-American 
social and cultural affairs. 

means. 
The importance of becoming a 

server was heightened after the 
completion of the training course 
when the children planned their 
own " invest j ture ." Everything 
from trie selection df the reading, 
Desiderata,.to the dropping of the 
baloons from the balcony was 
suggested by the* servers whose 
families gathered at the foot of 

t h e m a i n a l t a r i n t h e i r n e w 
M o n i c a ' s . 

the altar to share : irt the 
celebration. '*• • 

St. Monica's now has ^50 of 
» what they term servers, although 

the girls themselves sometimes 
lapse into the old terminology ' 
arjd call themselves altar* boys. 
This year the program wil) be 

. open to girls in the fourth grade, 
the age level when boys usually 
begin to serve, v 

A SPECIAL NEW 73 EDITION! 
LIVE! ON STAGE! 

A SALUTE TO WALT DISNEY* 
.PRODUCTIONS* 

HAPPY Y&P,S 

OPENS NEXT TUES. AUG. 28 
thru SUN. SEPT. 2 

ROCHESTER 
M E M O R I A L 

'Disney On Parade the 
best entertainment buy in town.'" 

—Toronto Son 

PRICES ?3.5Q |4.0O fS.OO 
all seats reserved 

CHILDREN (12 years .under) 
$1.00 off all performances! f 

TICKETS O N SALE Rochester War Memoripl . Sibley's Downtown 

All Sears Stores Noon to 9 P.M. GROUP SALES Ca l l 5 4 6 - J 7 4 0 

EVENINGS: 
TUES. thru SAT. 7-30 PM 
SUN.6I3DPM 
MATINEES: FRI. 2=30, PM , 
SAT.10:30 AM ft 2:30 PM 
SUN. 2:30 PM > « 

canisius and the academic bag 
The academic bag . . . it's fil led with 

creative people with innovative 

i d e a s . . . with over 30 excit ing major 

studies like physical educat ion a n d 

marketing... challenging courses in 
the humanities, sciences, business 

and education,.'. and new special 
programs like urban studies, commun­

ications, and fashion merchandising. 

At Canisius you'll f ind a Jesuit tradition 

backed by a century o ld reputation for 

scholarship. Yet, you'll have to look •. 

hard to f ind a col lege moving faster 

into the future. 

Canisius offers you the kind of environ­

ment that encourages questioning, 

learning, living and growing. Our 
b a g . . . it's involving the total person 

in the total educational experience. 

For more information about Canisius 

College or to schedule a tour of the 

campus and interview, contact Director 
of Admissions, Canisius College, 

2001 Main Street, Buffalo, New York 

14208 or call collect (716)883-5223. 

canisius college • it's the people who count 
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