
3 Auburn Parishes 
OK School Merger 

By MARY ANN GINNERTY 

Auburn — Parishioners of Holy 
Family. Sacred Heart and S t 
Alphonsus parishes voted Palm 
Sunday in favor of consolidation 
of their three respective elemen­
tary schools by 1,568 to 657. 

Implementation of the target 
date September 1972 was ap­
proved by a vote of 1,300 to 899. 

Public meetings discussing 
proposals had been held, but the 
need for registration and the 
deadline for applying for busing 
with public schools were the rea­
sons given for the early vote on 
consolidation. 

Several proposals had been 
under consideration, but the one 
adopted calls for Holy Family 
a n d S a c r e d H e a r t t o Jbtonse K i n -

dcrgarten through grades 4 and 
serve the north and south sec­
tions of the city respectively. St. 
Alphonsus will be established 
as a middle school housing 
grades 5 through 8. 

The current enrollment total 
for the three schools is 1,741. 
Projected enrollment figures un­
der consolidation are based on 
present enrollments and are 
subject to change based on bus­
ing considerations. It projects 
Holy Family with 268, Sacred 
Heart 218, and St. Alphonsus, 
508. 

At a public hearing last week, 
Msgr. Arthur Ratigan, chairman 
of the Tri Parish Parochial Edu­
cation Program steering commit­
tee (Tri-PEP) stated the budget 
for the operation of the three-
school system would be about 
$337,000. This proposed budget 
is about $23,000 lower than any 
current figure for the operation 
of the three schools. Cost per 
pupil for each parish in 1972-
73 wiuld be $340 per pupil. 

In addition to savings, St. Al­
phonsus Principal Sister Mary 
Dorothy, reporting for the aca­
demic committee, indicated con­
solidation could promote co­
operation, community, and in­
volvement, strengthen the re­
ligious education program, 
achieve basic economies through 
central purchasing, hiring and 
placement of teachers to better 
advantage. 

Sister Mary Dorothy indicated 
the middle school arrangement 
would assure that the children 
will go to the comprehensive 
high school from a broader 
base. They would have experi­
ence in departmentalization and 
working independently in a 
learning center. 

Other areas of development 
would include continued prog-
ress programs, teacher stimula-
t i o n b y w o r k i n g t o g e t h e r , a n d 

physical education for all cfiil-d r e n . 

She looked to specilization of 
the religious education program 
by training religious education 
teachers, the provision of more 
liturgy geared to age groups, 
and consolidation of the priests' 
services available. 

The plan accepted is different 
from one proposed earlier which 
would have divided the schools 
to house primary, intermediate, 
and middle grades. 

A breakdown of consolidation 
vote by parishes indicates Sacred 
Heart voted 307 yes to 48 no, 
Holy Family, 617 yes to 196 no, 
and St. Alphonsus, 644 yes to 440 
no. 

While' approving - consolida­
tion, St. Alphonsus voted 600 
to 484 against implementation 
in September 1972. Holy Family 
voted 555 to 231 in favor and 
Sacred Heart, 261 to 68 in favor. 

Father Raymond Wahl, pastor, 
Sacred Heart, reported at last 
week's meeting that his parish 
was spending $265 per pupil for 
the operation of its school and 
while it would jump to 340 per 
pupil under consolidation, he 
felt consolidation was needed 
as the way of salvation of Cath­
olic education in the city. Sacred 
Heart anticipates a $14,000 def­
icit this, year. 

Two additional parochial 
schools, St. Hyacinth's and St. 
Mary's are not included in the 
consolidation. 

A study done 4 years ago by 
Englehardt, Engelhardt, and 
Leggett, educational consulting 
firm, recommended consolida­
tion in some form. Since the 
recommendation was made, 
three schools, St. Francis, St. 
Aloysius, and Mount Carmel 
High School have closed. * 
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Better World' Theme 

Of Auburn Retreat 
Auburn — Traditional ideas 

were exposed to new light and 
shared by clergy, religious and 
laymen in a program of soul 
searching and growth recently 
as St. Aloysius was the scene for 
approximately 100 persons from 
the Auburn area who partici­
pated in the week long "Move­
ment for a.Better World" retreat. 

Under the guidance of a retreat 
team. Father John Mitchell, SJ., 
Sister Mary Madden, and Mark 
Wilkins, the process was de­
scribed as disturbing old tradi­
tions of compartmentalization 
and putting religion into per­
spective. 

Retreat Leader Father Mitch­
ell, explained traditional re­
treats are more reflective inward, 
and focus on the relationship of 
man to God, whereas the Better 
World Movement is more out­
wardly oriented to focus on 
horizontal movement and ap-
p l i c a t i o n of C h r i s t i a n p r i n c i p a l s 

in everyday life. 
Clergy, religious, and laymen 

experienced the feeling of com­
munity and the enrichment of 
shared ideas. Comments heard 
bore out the broadening view 
of Christian and church as going 
beyond self-interest in salvation 
and parish bounds. 

As bonds of understanding and 
communication grew, the re­
treat culminated by focusing on 
ways the fruits of increased self-
awareness and committment 
could contribute to the growing 
faith of the Christian community 
in the Cayuga Region. 

lary Madden sum-
; goals in her opening 

remarks |tHat the broad goal was 
to think jaoout the whole world, 
the human race, as one com­
munity; tol examine what can be 
done to bring the message to the 
whole world., and how, as in­
dividuals, we are going to do it. 

Sister 
marized 

Bishop Joseph L. Hogan, con-
celebrated Mass at the retreat's 
climax. Coconcelebrants were 
Msgr. James D. Cuffney, Msgr. 
Joseph J. Sullivan, Father 
Edward A. Shamon, Father 
Mitchell, Father John Mulligan, 
and Father Michael Conboy. 

FINGER LAKES 
Laundries and Cleaners 

COMPLETE HOME SERVICE 
Diaper Service 

Telephone 7 8 9 - 3 3 0 0 

511 Washington Si. 
Geneva, N.Y. 

LIQUOR STORE Inc. 

Auburn Area 
Notes 

W e e d s p o r t — T h e M e n ' s Clut> 

of St. Joseph's Church will serve 
a spaghetti supper Saturday, 
April 8 from 5:30 to 7:30 p.m. 

Auburn — The. Holy Family 
Home School Association Spring 
dance is scheduled Saturday 
April 8 from 9 p.m. to 1:30. 
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