
fSfS, fiti^WTuiure of Church Music 
By FATHER PETER E. 
SHEEHAN, C.S.B. 

This is the final article in a 
series devoted to church music 
Father Sheehan, of St. John 
Fisher College, has served as 
editor of the series and contrt 
bated toe first article. He is a 
member of the diocesan liturgi 
cal commission, secretary of the 
music commission, executive 
chairman of the 1967 Rochester 
Bach Festival, and a director of 
the Rochester Oratorio Society 
The line drawings which illus 
trated the articles of the series 
are the work of John C. Meni-
han, a member of St. Louis 
Parish, Pittsford. 

When the members of the 
diocesan music commission first 
conceived the project of pub­
lishing six a r t i c l e s in the 
Courier Journal, they intended 
to devote the final article to 
the future of church music as 
viewed by music educators. Two 
factors, however, now make it 
necessary to modify the scope 
of this article as it was original­
ly intended. First, the articles 
in the series have, to some de­
gree, already treated of the 
problem of musical education. 
Secondly, a most important con­
ference of the nation's leading 
liturgists and church musicians 
was held recently in Kansas 
City to discuss the future of 
liturgy and music. 

The conference in Kansas 
City, sponsored jointly by the 
U.S. Liturgical Conference and 
the Church Music Association 
of America, was entitled "Har­
mony and Discord: an Open 
Forum on Church Music." 

It can be said of the partici­
pants what was said of Ascot 
Opening Day in "My Fair Lady": 
"Everyone who should be here 
is here" — Archbishop Paul J. 
Hallinan of Atlanta, newly-elect­
ed chairman of the U.S. Bish­
ops' Liturgical Commission; Fa 
ther Fredericw R. McManus, di 
rector of the Secretariat for the 
Bishops' Commission on the 
Liturgical Apostolate; Archab-
bot Rembert Weakland, chair­
man of the Music Advisory 
Board of the same B i s h o p ' s 
Commission; F a t h e r Godfrey 
Diekmann, editor of "Worship"; 
composer, Alexander Peloquin; 
and, luminary of the arts, Barry 
Ulanov — to mention but a few 
of the 450 in attendance. 

The Diocese of Rochester was 
represented by Father Benedict 
A. Ehmann and the present au­
thor, both members of the litur­
gical and music commissions, 
and by Sister M. Florlan, S.S.J., 
of the music commission. Fath­
er Ehmann, in fact, played i 
prominent role in the confer 
ence as a discussion leader and 
as chairman of the resolutions 
committee which drafted the 
final proposal of the partici­
pants. The Eastman School of 
Music was als^represented by 
the Reverend Dr. M. Alfred 
Bichsel, chairman of its depart­
ment of church music. 
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Father Khman, Dr. Bichsel and Dr. Selhorst at Eastman School of Music 
d^cuss problems Catholic musicians, face in change from Latin to English 
tects for church rites. {• 

High Masses 
Now in English 

London—(NO—The bishops 
of England and Wales officially 
announced that the Mass may 
be sung in the vernacular and 
recommended that the music 
selected be easily adapted to 
full congregational participa 
tion. 

Giving pastors discretion to 
decide which parts of the Mass 
are to be sung, and also allow 
ing the use of some Latin in 
otherwise vernacular Masses, 
the bishops said that the local 
Ordinary must approve any de 
parture from the official text 
used in sung Masses. The bish 
ops also requested that the Ira' 
dition of the Latin sung Mass 
not be lost 

As often happens at such 
meetings, so much depends on 
who s p e a k s first. Archabbot 
Weakland of St. Vincent Arch-
abbey, Latrobe, Pennsylvania, 
opened the conference with an 
address which shaped subse­
quent discussions. His subject 
was "The History of the The­
ology of Liturgy in Relation to 
Sung Worship." In his talk he 
pointed out that two things hap­
pened as a result of the Sec­
ond Vatican Council's "Consti­
tution on the Sacred Liturgy" 
which radically changed the 
status of church music. First, 
congregational activity has been 
made an integral part of the 
liturgical action, w h e r e a s it 
previously had not been the 
norm. Secondly, the liturgical 
language was changed. 

Root of the Problem 

The result of these radical 
innovations is that both gregor-
ian chant and classical poly-
p h o n y have been rendered 
liturgically obsolete. Neither of 
them ever really was the peo­
ple's song in fact, since they 
were usually sung in monaster­
ies or by choirs. Furthermore, 
the musical settings of the Latin 
liturgical prayers, whether in 
chant or other forms, simply 
do not fit the English texts any 
more than they do the Japa­
nese or the French. 

The present crisis in church 
music, however, was caused by 
the total lack of preparation 
for the changes made by the 
Constitution on the part of 
church musldons. Ours then is 
necessarily a time of musical 
exeaUoa tad experimentation. 
It trill also be a tune of "quiet 
desperation," the Archabbot ob­
served, until we find a new 
musical expression proper to 
our present liturgy. 

The chief problem f a c i n g 
church musicians, according to 
the Archabbot, is their tend 
ency to live in the past and 
seek a golden age. This is ex­
emplified by those who look to 
the "Motu Proprio" of St Plus 
X and its quasi-consecration of 
chant and classical polyphony 
as a sort of "eternal" music 
which alone is worthy of the 
sacred liturgy. Neither of these, 
however, is really what is need­
ed in the church today. We are 
being-asked to experience com­
munity at Mass and we just do 
not have community music from 
the past which can really be 
called the people's music. For 
the time being we are musical­
ly dispossessed, he said. 

In presenting his historical 
perspective, Archabbot Weak 
land stated that "No age was a 
golden age as far as music is 

concerned. We cannot preserve 
the treasures of the past with­
out coming to terms with the 
false liturgical orientations that 
gave birth to this music. Nor 
can we preserve them accord­
ing to the false aesthetic judg­
ments of the last century. They 
can only be preserved for that 
which they are: beautiful pieces 
of music that served the past 
generations of the Church and 
of which we can be rightfully 
proud." 

Sacred vs. Secular Music 

In terms of the future the 
Archabbot said that musicians 
must learn that sacred music is 
not only an art in its own right 
but also one which, from the 
nature of its liturgical use\ will 
always be subordinate to the 
liturgical action and needs. Part 
jf our present anguish comes 
because we look upon the music 
of the past as something we 
love purely for its own sake and 
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not its liturgical function. In 
the future w e shall have to re­
main open and permit every­
thing, musically speaking, which 
will give contemporary Chris­
tians a rieli, relevant instru­
ment for expressing their litur­
gical prayer. He said that "we 
must be willing to stumble into 
the future.'* 

A final point from the con­
ference's opening address will 
serve as a corollary to what 
has been reported so far. If 
the Church is really in dire 
need of artistic creativity and 
muscal experimentaton, then 
musicians and liturgists must be 
prepared to> lessen the distance 
between t h e so-called sacred 
and secular music. 

The A r c h a b b o t maintains 
"There is n o supernatural music 
— not of tee past, nor the pres­
ent, nor of the future. If his­
tory teaches us anything about 
the conflict we constantly pose 

not exist" In support*of this we 
can mention the productive 
ages of Palestrina, Lassus, Bach. 

r 
A few days after returning 

from the conference in Kansas 
City, Father Ehmann, chairman 
of the diocesan music commis­
sion, met with two men who 
are in positions finely tailored 
to the future needs of church 
musicians in our diocese, Dr. 
Alfred Bichsel and Dr. Eugene 
Selhorst. The former, as has al­
ready been noted, is chairman 
of the church music department 
at the Eastman School of Music. 
Dr. Selhorst, a member of the 
diocesan music commission, is 
associate dean for graduate pro­
fessional students and .profes-
fessor of music literature at the 
Eastman School. In August he 
participated in the International 
Congress of Church Musicians 
which was held in Milwaukee. 
During his interview Father 
Ehmann put several questions 
about the musical future to the 
two professors. What follows 
here will be a reporting on their 
assessment of the present and 
their prognostications for the 
future. 

Communication, Education 

This era of renewal, Father 
Ehmann observed at the begin­
ning of the interview, is a time 
of tensions and dialogue be­
tween musicians and liturgists, 
musicians and clergy, musicians 
and the people. Since no pack­
aged solutions are available, 
differences will have to be set­
tled t h r o u g h communication 
and education. He asked what 
the Eastman School of Music 
as an institution for the educa 
tion of professional Jmusicians 
can contribute to the local com-

Sacred Liturgy" opened up a 
rare possibility for creativity on 
the part of composers. It offers 
a challenge of which teachers 
such as the Eastman School's 
Wayne Barlow and Bernard 
Rogers are keenly aware. It is 
part of their, tasks to encour­
age composers, especially the 
students, to become interested 
in creating instrumental and 
choral music which will fill 
liturgical needs. Such composi­
tions must necessarily represent 
a rich diversity of approaches 
and solutions. 

The disparate backgrounds 
and sensitivity of both compos­
ers and congregations demand 
that there be composition along 
more traditional lines as well 
as experimentation by those 
whoo are more radical in their 
art. Dr. Selhorst added that, 
while there is no really certain, 
ideal kind of church music, 
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Noted Athlete 

To be Nun 

Rome — (RNS) — Elsa Pas 
quali, 25, one of Italy's leading 
woman athletes, has abandoned 
sports to enter a Benedictine 
convent, ilJKas reported here. 
Hailing from Schio in northern 
Italy, she set an unofficial wom­
en's record last year for the one 
mile run. 
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