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THE GRANDMA INTERFERENCE 

Sheehan Dean & Co., Ine, 

0MMENDED: 
to thg aft̂ n who want practicality . 
who {misTo* <$urabiltty . » . ' 
who consider -style and want 
their motiey's-wotth of clothes. 

HerriiigbcMtte Slacks 
Styied^wtth the same handsorue lines as tfcas* 

4 .Wrote expensive ones . . . as comfortable ens your 
• favorite shpp#s and just as rugged t ^__ 

50 $ 3 9 S $5°° $ 7 
FUUD5 and SOLID COLORS; TAM, BROWM. 
and OSfFOltf) SLUE.. . . . . . . . . .SEES 30 to *0 

Sports Jackets 
Uta^di.-sippejred ffosii—d morn's perennial 

.' '--4cWi5t"flit Wtfc fcfttf packets, a belted bock and a self 

SA95 

i'^ngs!' SMrts 
^ W *?rrfv»dl ^i 4brawJ «ew Shtprttnt ol your 

j1 IwwrfSsv fhWvwIth the cwfqptcrae fabric coll* thcrl fe 
«wdran*»Nd Jo anient 1h» srfirt »ta»lU 

j 
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4ui'ili inTniWi a^lMtoMB 

The estimable gray-halted lady 
was *«d unit crestfallen. Her 
<lHU|!it«r. fuU! tola her Co move 

out, Mid to %o «nd 
l ive somewhere 
dint 

"No, random: 
that Un't ponslble, 
for I know you? 
dAuglltw" 

"I « m telling you. 
B.ho did " 
plain what w*i» 
the provocation?" 

"13i« otUer nlgltl, »ft«r he? b«by 
lyfu put % bed. it sUtrttderylnx, 
*nM It crlodf aiid cried and cried. 

Sh« went In t o ice if there w»» any-
thing wrop*, «nd, when »he dlicov-
ered nothing of an unusual nature. 
*he cloud the window* -arid t h e . 
bedroom door and In It cry for over J 
nn hour. I wanted to g o in and pick 
up tho poor thing, and Chen abo told 
me angrily that If 1 was bent on In­
terfering wl«» her raising her chtl-
dren, 1 bad better get out" 

"Tell mo-after It cried /or over 
an hour, what happened?" 

'Wturatly, the little precious WM 
exhausted, and It fell asleep." 

"When did oil this happen?" 
"Monday night." 
"Did It happen again Tuenday 

night?" ' 
"Yea, tho same thing, but not so 

bad." 
"And Inst night?" 

' "Lost night, wo did not h«nr « 
peep out of it, but I'm *o miserable 
about my daughter's telling me 
that, after aB I did for her!" 

If grandmothers.only would un­
derstand that tliey can do no 
earthly good by spoiling grnnd-
chlkircn. things would- move along 
much more aniootltly in many a 
home. Rlrst of nil, by their Ui-
dul^ag klaslasss, th^y may ruia 
parental discipline; secondly, they 
make the task more difficult, and 
they irritate the moUa«r. who i* 
sometimes already on edge on ac­
count of the child's tantrum or its 
unreasonable notions and bad dis­
position; thirdly, the h«rmony and 
good feeling in the home are de­
stroyed. 

It 1% strange how a grandmother 
who'has raised her ow» family to 
an excellent and successful man* 
ner will unconsciously place ob­
stacles in line way of her daugh­
ter and »oa who want to follow 
her good example Tn rearing chil­
dren. 

While the young mother waa 
bathing her sore eye, »he was In­
terrupted by the telephone ringing. 
When she walked back to the! 
bathroom, she- . Just caught little 
Patricia gulping down the eye , 
wash. Mamma gave her a good 
spanking. Grandma promptly ar­
rived on the sceno from which the 
infantile yells came, and she 

j scolded the moth-r for being so 
cruel 

"Alter all. that lotion was not 
poisonous." ?> 

The "datigrhter explained to 
Grandma that it was her fault-
that the child got a good l.tttlo 
thrashing — -which announcement 
sounded outrageous to the totally 
innocent grandmother tall she Was 
reminded, Bessie recalled that, of 
all the whippings she got in her 
ehltdhtwd, front her mother, thtf 
grandmother of the present drama, 
the worst waA when she had got 
hold Of a snrnll bottle -with poison 
In it and w a s caught in the act of 
tasting it. 

"Mothtr. £au were aa frantic* 
and. you licic*U me s o hard that 
oven today1 I have a dread of one 
of 'my children drinking anything 
•when fhey don't Miow what it i *r 

$bftt Qraadihaf sornewhat sheep-
IshT • • • • • -

What makea jWomen as gpnd-
niothers *> Wconsrstcinay d»»re*t 
from what t»ey wtte « * m o t e * ? 
C u it not .fefe that they -oftetii »eK-
iahly love tl^r-:g^ndcWadr*h ttot* 
thaa they d « thlir o « n c^£ldrcnf 
S*lfl*hne». yes—thsf aiust be at 
taahottem o f I t At rnothers, they 
toik their children's aftectttn and 
attachment for-grsntedl they *«** 
with them al l day lORg/ and they 
dtd m many things for them when: 
tfwy. wewttttSJllttt *»*« S»* .»«#-
narlly with grandawther*; since 
t*»y «• not-hav* the *a«ne ojpor-
taal««« t» w«k.tlieist*sd>«r.4at* 

t«« m«««. u-m* »ta» mm •&**¥< 

they 4a re t*«*»#*aw- < c # N • » 
tint cfciHhreiav ^ j g ^ j ^ N f %" 

~ tJsa -..jî awapgatera -jfct. 

such a way that Grandma always 
will be vepy welcoma and will be 
considered their stanch defender' 
in case tho going U » little hard 
at time*- Result: the "kid*" are 
crs.y about Grannie, but they are 
spoliid, a t the same .time, for par* 
entul discipline la undermined, and 
Mother hait lite trouble afterward. 

If this analysis seems to be too 
farfetched, then think of the 
grandmothers who. forced by mis­
fortune, have to raise grandchil­
dren. They do not follow the- same, 
policy and , method. They punish. 
and wward In the'itnme .logical 

i-wny ni they raised their own chil­
dren, TJhwe Is not milch fa!** and 
damaging: pity and generosity 
shown the young one*, even if they 
arc orphans, for whom it ia nat­
ural to feet more pity. 

Grandmothers should make it a 
rule, when there i s a storm brew­
ing or Breaking, t o take a walk to 
tho drugstore rind buy a pint of 
ice cream for daughter, /to help 
her cool down after tho ordeal is 
over. Daughter will love her the 
more for It. and the grandchildren 
arc more apt to be grateful to 
Grannie in filer years. 

SON CONDUCTS FINAL RITES 
FOR JOHN KILLACKEY 

Funeral of Mr. John KHIackey. 
father or Rev William KHIackey. 
pastor at St Paul of the Cross 
Church, Honeoye Falls, was held 
on Wednesday. Feb. 11. 

Solemn Requiem High Mass was 
celebrated: by 'Rev . William Kll-
lackoy, assisted by Rev. Howard 
Gcck ss Deacon, the Rev. Dr. John 
fteddlngtoxs -L» Sub-JD-agOB * n g th-
Rev. Francis Pccney as Master of 
Ceremonies. The Mass was sung 
by rttsv. A. M. Kavanagh and Rev. 
Joseph Raiffey. 

The following members of the 
clergy were present in the Sanctu­
ary: Rt. Rev. HSKS\ William Hart, 
V.Q., Rev, Thotoss J\ Connors, 
Rov. Louis—Sdelmann, Rev. Fran­
cis Mason, Rev. John Ball, Rev 
George Dond. Rev. Raymond lynd 
and Hev. Dr. Edward Lints. 

Interment was made In St. Paul's 
Cemetery in Honeoye Falls. The 
Blasslng at the grave was given t y 
Monslgnor Hart. 

Our Lady of Uur«J«» 

COMMUNION SUNDAY LCIED 
Members" or the Altar Society will 

receive Holy Communion on Sun­
day, March 1-

The Holy Name Society will bold 
a Communion Breakfast on Sun­
day, March s, Lawrence W. Hast­
ings, chairman" of the affair has 
announced the breakfast will be 
held at the Mark Twain Hotel 

' Masses during tent will be said 
every day during Lent at 7:30 and 
» o'clock. On Wednesday there is 
only one Mass at I o'clock. 

SCAPULAR M I I I I A INITIATES 
NEW OFFICIAL PUBLICATION 

NEW YORK - The Scapular 
Militia hss Just jubUshed the first 
number of its new printed official 
organ. The Scapular. 

The four-page publication will be 
Issued- quarterly and supersedes the 
mimeographed bulletin formerly 
Issued to members of the Scapular 
MiliUa. Among other things the 
publication announces that the 
Scapular Militia will mark its first 
anniversary on April 15 and the 
magazine will mark this event in a 
special way. 

CHI'RCII tiOOIXS LEAUKft 
New York Fred P Hansen, 

president of D B Hansen & Sons. 
Chicago, dealers In church goods 
and religious articles, was elected 
president of the National Associa­
tion Of Catholic Publishers and 
Dealers In Church poods at the 
national convention hern 

Nun-Nurse Aids Surgeon 
In Four-Hour Operation 
While Planes Bomb City 
MAItYKNOLL. N . Y,-During a 

four-hour surgical operation per­
formed to Lotlng, South China, 
while enemy > planes were flying 
above, the only American trained 
nurse In the city. Sister Monica 
Mario Boyle of Minersville, Piu, as­
sisted the only doctor there, also 
an American. The surgeon having 
already begun -to operate before 
the nif raid signal was given, there 
was rib alternative but to continue 
during the bombing attack. Fortu­
nately, it was a day-time raid, so 
that no black-out was involved. 

This is ono of many dramatic 
incidents related i n the first offl-
cial reports front South China mis­
sions that nave been reoeWtai *t 
the Msryknotl Sisters' Mother-
house Since the outbreak of war. 
Most of t h e letters just now re­
ceived were written ia October. 
Sister Monica Marie, graduate of 
Misericord!* Hospital Training 

f
SchoclrPhiladelphia- who ha* been 
In China Since Mi, is on% of 210 
Msryknoll Sister* new In^I^acinc 
war stinea* -

Because of the prevalent scarcity 
of feed and the d&ease* resulting 
front undernourishment, Catholic 
missiontra in China,, now entering 
upon the fifth year of war, are oft-

i*n the only source. *f aM.-/•» fcelp-
Itss horde* o f sick and shelterlets. 
Touched* by the kindness o f the 
misstoners, .Many are seeking to 
-li^c^iifw^fjhi^hma^, _ ' ,. 

. Alklnso* jkaas. ^Benedictine 
(•HMncfcaut -<m eeiuotrir atr 
t* _ - tibe ̂  eoBsmasd-ty :M jfc. 
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Final Week 
m OUR 

February 
Furniture Sale 
EDGCOMB'S 

161 N. MAIN ST. 

OFFICE HOURS 
9:30 'TU. 5 

SATURDAY'TIL 6 

DR. W. C. C0MTORT 
Otigssntel • *rk* «>««ey *«* 

Ceatpkte Oytkal ̂  Serdee 

MY LOW nm 
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