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‘I‘he uruouc JousNaL:18 gold: by thc
tollowlng pewsdealers, and can. be obu\fned
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HIS HISTA K BS

Otthﬁl&ca to the’ exolﬂslvg use:of the |
word ¢ (atholic” | He. said that the |
* Romish Obaroh wasnot universal,
Tt was divided in mattersof dootrine. |
indaad he said, that one infallible
pope bad auapended the order .of]
- Jesits, and snother mmliipie pope.
C had teimtsg,ed them, hence from. thig
* Jogioal reasoniog be deduced that the |

. infallibi ity dogma: was s ferce.  The |
Aootor, produced & " Qatholic Chargh.
mtechmm to show: tbat Catholics:
~were tanght ‘o be subservient to the
" cbureh, to fight shy of the Bible; to
beliove that" Proteatants wouid be |
‘damoed, and many otbel‘ tbmgn of
ike chnaober S

The above in eb. extract from tha
* pewspapet réprt of Rov, Mr. Merrills
~ sprmos aiAsbory Ohnrch ln this oity
lut Sondsy .

"It makes 0o diﬁel‘éns:e t,o om- Bo!y
© QOburoh ‘what tile: those: onlaldo her
- fold m“qumae poder. “They mey |
oall thomselvea ]lethodluus Episco |
pm.limmt Froo Mothodista, B-ptim
° Presbyterisne, Universalists, Unitar-|

Thiy may oall themselves Oatho-
Yickif they chose: - Old Qstholics,”
<t Holy Gathiolics,” “Oothphca, ‘The |,
» Church fs ‘sot. _copcerned” with the|
_name ‘which 8:body of herotica: or
. achismatics muy- adopt What .he
‘does hold; and she lbuuders forth the.
pronuncimeuzo with t.he voice of God.
Bjmae!f—-io that. none:ate membera

Catholio and Apostolical Oburoh. ex-
"copt those who, will desr ber ‘voice|
“and be guided {6 matters of faith by
> her pupreme head, thie Vlcsr of: Ohnqt
* onecarth. v
The ~ofxuge that the - Oburob is not
uqurul ;but at iedi vided ip mutteu
of dootrine is false. Perbiaps Mr.|
ﬁum‘ll {bmko tbat beoause Arch-]
bishop lrdsnd does not hold exscdy
. the ssmeé: views a8 to the danger to
faith inourred by Oatholia children in,

. Arohbishop-Corrigan, there i . -dif-.
ference,too,in the dootrine hughz by
~ the two prglum “This ia not 80. ’l‘be
Ghnroh will always &llow . reuons-
b!a smount of liberty to her hllht)pu

" im the sdoption of s policy. but aa re-|.

gatds the' grest essentisls, the' doo--

trines which Oliriat oomniuionod her :

to teach thronghout all ages and b |
- ‘ionm,they are the same in St. Paul-as
in New York, tbe same in- Funce a8
T Germavy, the mme in Qnebee
in Rio do-Janerio.- -

- Oatholics are not umght to boheve
tlmt all Protestaats will be dmned
If Dr. Merrill g:t!lerad such & mean”
ing from the words of the catechiam
- be must be s very ignorant man,
True, the catechism does say that' all
menst belong to the true Cburch or be
cendemned. 1t also teackes that out-

“put Dr. Merrill,in the pausity of
wledge and ignorance of Cath-
m‘aoetrim,did not know thas immy
yod Protestants who Iesd good
$ées aud are not awsre of the error
in following Ptomhn-
Iy belong i thé sonl of the
he teaching of

| Memll io evidently not even aware:

ot the  distinction. -
g’wa(mt blunder, bowever, is m»dein '

mhumeylnncn :

= i:ngb&

‘maips. of the former prelstes of’ &be
| provisce. Archibishops Corrigan, -

be found. mtereaung, 1
" Michail Josepb O’Fsrrell woe. born '

tha Uhim S“wl
charge of Bt Patrick's: Ohurcb. New:
{York, trensferred to St.. Peter’s. and:

8% | cases affiliated itselt . with ~the Re-|

of + faith and mlmﬂb bnt Nr:

Mr. Merrills.
.pomtmg w the suppression of . the

Teavits by one Pupe, snd their re-in-|
. | etatewent - by “another,” es '8 proof

agamat the” cla m -of mfslhblh_ty by
¢|the Papacy

{I‘bere 'Ws 10 question]
“lof doctrie iy &he suppteaplon of the.
Jesuits, . It wae mewly LS que;mon
of dxsmphno ,

" My Memll ﬁula to draw a dminc.
tion bezween mauera el dmclpllne
'&nd mauers of dootrics. Accord)ng
to bis, view, sbould ‘afuture. Governor:
‘of South Carol(nt'

Z‘ilfmn recently dis: |

tsnceo m:des which each; action: #a
taken both Goverm:s mtght :

Had Mr Mernll followud thc ad~

' "_fivtce which a broad-mlnded mmlster"_

) -]'recemly gave‘ bls bn t,hren
: fOsthohc sc»mcee (or mformauon o’
" }\ [ Catbiolic doot.nne, be_ would gob have’ 8ingp eleotion.
| made quch o ndwnlous exhibnipn of

‘..ignorance on, ﬁns subject
He repudisted tho clmm of B,oumn )

'{) 80 (‘Uj

BISHOP O’FARBELL

" —

Destb hae been” busy smong '.ha
prelalen of the New York Province
since the “death of- Bishop Laaghlis, |
of Brooklyn made Y bresk in Lbeu‘;
‘ranks three yoars 8go;
time Blsbopl Wadbams of Ogdens '
burg, llQNleruey, “of . Albupy, and
lastly Bishop - O’Fam:ll of “Trenton,
who -died hst week baye followed:
the venerable’ Brooklyn prelat.e in
quiok ‘Buccession, - .Thero- DOw ' re.

“of
New York, Bishops ngger of New..
ark, N. J Ludden of 7 Syncnse
Rysn,  of Buﬁ‘alo, ‘and ' oBf oW
‘B;ohop Rt Rev Boroard J. McQ,nmd
> Bishop Gabnels presides over tha |-
See once govemed by meop W ad-

that of Btshopa Laughhn, leaving:
the. two Sees . of Albany aod, ‘Trenton.
vacant:; The follomng shor¢ skieteh |
of the late Oi‘dinuy of Treuwn will i

i0- Limerick, - Ireland, “December. 9,

1882 ‘He beggn* bis studics in “that
famous idstitotion, . All- Hallows Ool

lege, and about 1860, entercd "the:
Semivary of St. Sulpice, ii_Parls. He!
finisbed his atddies at the French: eol:
lego and returmng to Ireland was or
dained a priest ob Augnat 18,1885,
‘He resolved at the time to become 8!
‘member-of the Snlpithn Osder. and |
(ar that purpose entered-the’ nomiuw
in Paris After: going  through tb&
rigorous courae . prespribed he wes'
made professur of dogmatio thoology
|in the college- of - the order- at- the.
Frenchi capital, A few years later be:
| went to. Osnada ‘and- was'at once ap-
pointed a professor in- the Sulpntiu
Oollege at Montréal. - Thén carrying:
out o long-oherished wish, be came 101-
He wai plaved in:

{in 1879 beoﬁme pastor ‘st Roundoat.
‘He returaed to_St. Peter’s -after that,
and- Rave special attention to ednos-
tion, for'which hewas- eminently ﬁtwd
‘He founded & school there that was!
the wonder and sdmiration of the en:
tire state and which was. counted ono
oj the ﬁnest in the lcnuntry

AN UNHOLY ALLIANO’E
Retnma frOm the téoent electiom
in muny Westeru cities show the ‘A.
P A had in the gt majority’ of |

};lioon party, and has bean wel
oomed by the once G 0 P wnth open‘
afma.

" the Bepublicam ptrt.y in -to
father the A P A movement it the
Weatem States and. wherever the A.
P.Ais strong énough toturn the|
ecale in. form " of Repubhoan candi. |
dates; then the Ustliolics’ throughont
the entire country must pumsh it]
where ‘they are - strong. If in Den.|
ver, Milwaukee, Psoris, and a hun-

do not hold the balance of power|

bold. the -whole: Republiosn - body
responsible for the ulenm of it

meémberi-~ It ‘Ostholics in " thess
= sre foroed ato the orad

" The Poge u iofalible only whew be |ri
|spesks. ex-Cathedra, on queqﬁmr

: i voted w!umn of ‘its frst page: to:

I lﬂhe reorgan g
| ization; ‘of  the mlllury companics’
| which - Gov,
'f.bsnded 1% nonld prove thst une of |
| the Go%mors ‘had erred whereos,
| "ogring to s, dxﬂ'etenca in the ctrcam-

edltor of thg Drmocre.c wwbed
»,;,‘,ebleld ehe A ‘P. A
’.dlspawb toemt bls purpoae

Since that|_°

Tman ‘wbo logtcally denies: mfalllbillty"
jia be who saye: "l do “dot. know. "
‘men. eay s Thpre i o ‘such’ tbing o8}

-t6 the Father.

l.is this that He smth A httle while?

r:tho\xzh Christ meant to say:.

dred other oitics, the ::aholy sllisnoe|
s xept up because "the Catbolios |

botween the two parties we ‘must pos

IB&O tha Democrauc party, ‘t.oo

A DJSPA T()H 1)0(, 'ORED

Tbﬁ i’out Exprew lsaued an- e

o8 Oity. between the A “P.'A. ‘and
'.he AntlA.. P A Ihe Huaid de-

{the* séme, event. "Both the. above:
Vjonmals staz,ed Lbst. -the: trouble wag.
caused by ‘the A P queamon
The-- ‘Union, tuo, publmhui thie”izerp:
“The Democrst ‘and:
Wednesdsy momug dnd 0ot give-
‘the item on its: telegraph page 1o
‘elead n. p!aCﬁd it:on ther local page,;
‘with every m!ereuce to the AP,
tfrom. the uttcle ‘The lnference
is qmle namrally 10 be drawn “;‘I’he

and altered tbe
I wlll
.be borue ln mlud Lbat Lhe last nsmed
'poper bas Bot- wnwmed ope hu& of
editoriak d|eapproval of : the A. P A
Thpm is 8 ausplcnon

18 of ebe orgsm &

suw ic.a poamon towurd tha A.~ P.A;

Tbe grﬂt msJorlty of tboae Wboé
deny the existence of. lnfalliblhty by |
word adniit it. by pncuoe, The omly

1

‘,mhllibnlity, they &re tbempei:vess

jpreschiog the very docmne they cop
:demau, otbers for
?momselves clatm lnfalhbimi when.

-accepting. ~They

t.bey say " It ie non, or e I& m"’

He Las"

N st.ion&] Li‘gxalatnré

THL G(NPLLS

-8ée: Me,” and, becouee 1-go o thel
Fat.he:? They .said- thereforés ‘Vhal,

We. Koow pot what ‘He. - apeshzth
Aod ‘Jesue. knew. that they bad s
‘mind to ask. Him, and Ho ' eaid ‘to
‘them: -OF this do-you: inquire. amoig:
youreel és,. becsusel said: A litile
bile, and yoa-ehall ‘not. aee Me; and
agein s littie while, you uhsu 800

Augusz‘ne explalns the Gospel- nsi

__** After My siicension sinto helven you.f
My-apostles, will-. weep and be ‘sorrowful.
through pmehinge w: and the Gospel,

| becaiise 'you will nuge' for the rmge and}
. endity of the ersecutors, and  the wonld-
lmgl will réjoice .over Lour. sufferings and |
your death; bnt after the short time that this/|
world will "last T shall “comie to . judge. the
‘living and the ‘dead, and then yoursorrow
'will be tyrned into joy and. eternal glory, and
‘the insane rejoicings of the wicked will be
clnn inta confasion, sorrow- and- muery,’
which will never “have an end.” - ‘

Weekb’ Church Cﬂendar

SUN Amm, 13, —Third Sunday nfter Eas
“ter.- Patmnage of . St.: ~

" .Gen. xlix, 22-26; GGSp Luke fil 2t
Mon, 19.~—Feria, -

C\WED. 18 —Feria, .

"THURS, ig.ﬁomce of the. Bleased Sacn\
ment;, ...

Fri ro—Feria,

| Sar. 21 ~St, Anselm. Bishop, Confessor,

md Do::tor of “the Chnrch. -

We Con\dn’t Re:ist I:

ket books at s figure that wej
‘couldn’t resist.. Weo acoepted.” ¥ou|
will see some of them in the north|

for 080, We ¢;

is ‘monith.
Houry Likly & Co, 96 a‘!tbsmtrm

mw

- o~ nold | - 066(“}0&’36361”34“4“ '
ﬁle bahnce of puwer m our cmes | departman

wd s1ates, vnH O bag and’ baggage 3

‘\hem Monday cve:

trs Toesday evemug of last weok |
givmg the news of the ot in Kam,

Cnrun mle of .

.:sbrosd taat. Lha Demucrnt ia hot bos-
[ tile'to the "A P ;
) felecmm denuném i
Vlzsuon wére’ only meam 10 calch:
:QUuholie votes - for _ lhe Repnblmsni
’»caod!dute (or Mayor
'_grest many ‘of the’ Democrav’e Cathohc; ’
,reade?s would be " p[eued to see it

g Mra Geo. Schwaiz, No. 625, st the Y- , | ST Sl L 1, ‘ r - / ‘ ”
ouday evemag of lasz Lms [
We believe a‘*;day evemng the Yonng Meg’s Catholic|: . LR T e T T e

- Tobl'

fl Benry J: Resand,

rccantly 1
‘8epl an éditor to. thar brauch o( tbe .

, {Iy the. membam of b!»
:: Y M A L

OOSPBL Sl John xvl 16-22 —-ff
1At that time, Jesus said to His - dig-‘i
Giples: A hu.lc_ while,-apd you ahall
-Bot see: Me: and sgain a’ little: wblle'
;and you shall’ seo Me: because. E go
Then , some of Hisf
duscxplen said “one 16 anotber "Wiat.
*1is this that o saith to -ue’
_lwhile ‘aod 'you shall not sée Me oid |
Asgaln 8. little - whlle

h’ulef

and” you ‘aball’

18 1" pected:but. welcome visitor, s
‘There 'will. be:av mceting of ;the: Ccmnl B
X Board at'the, residedice .of - ]ohn 1 chrom 1
i ';2 Emmeft St o

Me? Amen, aumeo I say to you, that
‘oo shall Tament and. weep,: ond the - -
‘world. chtll be ade sortowfal, dat|
'your sorrow sball be tarned, into joy. |
‘A 'womup, wheo slie.is in; l.bor hathf -
sorrow; because; ber:hour - is. ‘ootme:
‘but when she bath brougbt forth. the |
‘child, she remembereth ' no. nicre. ‘the:
‘angmeh for joy that*a.' man. is-born |
into the.world. 'So also- you oow- io-
‘deed have:sorrow;, but. I will see you
again, tnd your beart shall rejoice:
| and-your joy o man - ohall uke fronf
R you" ) 2

it'or sale. .

gthoae who have used it in:the past| . g
bave asked for more  and - compelled { .-, -
' For the over-worked g | e
““|-ness man, “the. tired, nervous woman, | - .

“for every bbdy who is 4 :
{ ap by the spring wesxber, it is just | ¢

TuEs, 17.~St, Aniceius. POpc and Manyr -

‘ h:ghmt grade Patent flour.
‘and best flevored made by Rochester|. ' .
Got ofyeur grocer. A ww

We wero offeved & lurge siook ¢ of |

window. ‘Regular $1.50 pocket books! .~ -
xpeot to cleau.up thej -

Ti{ 0.39(,*

conmm. this

vwd
be sddresied; to Bro. T l{ml

_('“: B C v v zxcunsmn :
A; ameetmg “of the R C,U. U
“it. was demded o
{ bave s Excursiod Jane 25h to the |
Cowventionof the Koights -.of St
Jcun; 10 be beld at Baflalo. N Y.
- The foll

A Schlick,. Lt. Col; Jobn Rauber,
‘Capt:. Jos. . Stullkneebz, (;apt Aug
~Pappen (;spt. J J I\;anmold

B (}nnd Deputy Aughew ’ Scbenl of
| the: diodese of Rochenter had l.be dige
+iog uished bleasuie of being one of .
“the invited. guemtsof the €1 M B A
| Adviscry Board of "New, York . city.
‘He speaks very - comphment.uy o!
Jthe. ‘bospitality'  of - cur butem
%broth»rs and bad-a:fine’ time at the.r
‘banxdet: .. Brothér- &cilell ‘and Orand
1-Pregidént Ryan wery’ somewha& at.
jodds tegardiog - 1o, what | cmnpnaas
the diocesesof - Rncb?ster, avd.’ bh?y
| waited upon Grazd Chnncellor
‘Muench’ to give, them. thé desired ‘ip:’
“formation, . which’ of : course he: dld;
‘aud was sble to greet the twodlgmm-
ries ‘of the' N Y.~ Graand Cooicil at!
“bie: pbarmm.y ow bunéay Essu—éym
clse Uaﬁm&w Sun N A

: R £ oG o
'Ibe (‘atbedral Clock was, won by :

‘M. (.0 M
Aweek E
‘At SS Pem and Pani's Hali Muu-

Clabs ~of that ‘and - 8t Joseph’ej

-abd: apprecistive audience. tho follow: |
jog- pmgtamma

K 3
i

gres

:FASH"{O"

,?iff’S 6ME

Howing, Com. were sppmnt :
ted to. wake - the necessary atrange-1
‘ments. Et. Dominick Kzaft, Col -H| -

Qhurchés’ p:gsemed before a. lasge |

Ofennre Eerman

_Qur spacmm Cloak Réom.. R I
. After the Storm £l

%tmu}taneoualy with brigbtening skies, we

m isurrs, LAm AND J,m'xm
Look at t.hese SL ITS

1Tt is not to Sf‘ewhatyou have kmked
at befere that we invite you m VlSIt

I
" 0

.
o
X

nnf@ld to :

S ”.:: tbe hldze-a of Rochester the® besﬁaﬁorts of makers R

B, vcry one . taxter-ms&a, ﬁmshed in avﬁl'y

detall a8 (arefnlly as 8 Pttth Avenne tailor. hvmuld finish the finest . -

eqat
m (,overt u]uth aml blue black au& mlxed HErges. |

makers prodn(‘e
J ACK F'['S

an*e Alberts in, (zovert (,lotbs and Cutawa;s sud Tﬂxeaoe&

hesxdes mhﬂ béat New Xbrk

Y

Jmmty Beefars, elegamﬁ t;igbt,.ﬁttmg Kerseys Wxth

r.VEBYBODY

on,‘heaua oelect lun,, _

;:eoprano solo, Mlaa bmma Haeker,|

recitation, “Tbe Qolonel .and. l"|
Frank Nagéli - violia - solo, |
‘Heury Kimwmel; Ind'hm “elub swmg~
Apg,  Mise: Lora ‘Clapoy; - recitation,.
Bave "Malowe; baes 8olo, Obarles'
f(wrstner Phxlnumonic qmnwtte ’

Durmg -the - «amerts;nment Seo’, ‘
o Ushalf  of ‘the'
‘members of the Y. M. C: 0. presentéd |
Babe Maloné with 4 boaciuetof roges
‘and e gold badge with- tbe followmg

‘ T oscription onit.,
Gov Oglivw 0( Georgm, does not', :

'behcye thé Seoate. ehould be-a- M\l,_ :

me add:- Bishop: McDonneH over,l“m"mé’ Clob -

F‘!orence G Ma!nna fnm ‘KQ Peter
and Pauls Y, M 00, Aprit 9 1804 !
. The: enwttainmeuk O}mmlt{,ee f

voligteered to gssist -them espectot
Joeepb’s C

Tbo pnucipal evene i 0 M B A“
ch‘clea this wezk hag been the recép-
‘tthn’ given by Branch 98im the grand
pew -hall of the Immaoilate Qoucep-
“thon.. The' aflair was 8 grand anccess
“and er! tyed. by all’ who- atwnded

“Next: week comes. the anmversm"y |
“celobration of Braick 81 at ‘8t Jo-.
sepb’e Hall Monday evemng -A pro-|
gramme . wag gnvm i the Jocrmu_
last week . :

oy AND B4
chnesd:y cvenmg' ‘T'wo candidates weére

Recorder Honora' "McCarthy was.an unex

ncxt Tncsday cvemng

R -

P ;‘.',»

,}. . . -

souxmmo mzw o
0!" mtmro ALL L? amwrnn

-ased it for years, . results ‘being 80
vory lesting: snd good that meny of |

ity gale.

it all broken

the thing. " The proprietors of the

“Telfair Sanitarium can ampply ifin]
paira or amg]e bottles, snd can send. ;l; o
1t.by. express or dehvery ‘wherever|

wanted, ‘Theprice_is four dollars| -
per pair or two’ dollom per smglo’
bottle.. A trial  will . convince you'
that the Telfeir Spocnl Tomc i &
way &head uf tny other you bave
ever used; e T .

Party and Weddmga mvn,auons 8
specialty at thm otﬁce. C

A Purely Domeltic Bmd 1
Antlmny’a Cream Bread. mudefrcm

meoh;amcs.

oo e

. The Bmy Beeis L,uiﬁets ' i
Compared with Sonith - & Patrie’s
‘workmen Just now.
fers, and will give your order prompt.
atentmn. No a9 Eaat lhm -!reet

1 .
w

lfor Bale or To Rent‘

SL,

Logrie: and- thllmn Flsher,itenm
‘Bolo,

(‘onncnl 23 ‘hadian intmlng mecting lut s

‘initiated, and ssveral ballsted: foi Suprcxnc -

The. something - tew is.tiot D Tel» SRR
:fm’a wonderfnl cpring tomc! but the- v
faot. that: ke has codoladed to offe it. o

‘He: has ‘prescribed. nd}

v‘_‘

L
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$11 000 two big factories:

F qbaf@r apd Wlllmm It“d

-

Woth of \aw- %pnng Haha, tho entiro umput“{}f

READ. ABOUT - IT—William "
- of the firin of Meng & Shater, have

Just: roturned from New York whero they bought from- the-hat facts-

theirentire vutput for Sprmg of 794,
Fine. Hats for- ‘gentlegien..

Fl(il’RF FOB SPOT CASH. -

chase
et,ook that Wi not mude ﬁns £€480N -
been heurd of befom

(‘es that ha\ o newr

:.“‘ s, N - N v 3

Y

“ - Lo - Y e P P
R T T . -y S SO N

P N

Y. M. C 0.- wishes to expre”}nes of Crofat & ‘White. ‘apd Byroo Dexter; ot Danbiry, Conn:,
mmr anks to 8l thoss who so, kind: “They -are manﬂfuottﬁ‘em of
. Every-one in.the lotig brand new, uf the
Ivery latest block and correct styles, :bab 1 the hard times and over pro-

‘|duction ‘compelled them to part with tbetr goodsAT A VERY LOW

o’

‘We mll give the people of Roches{ex tho bengﬁt of. ou par-
"We guarantee that [,bere i§ ot & hat i the entirc mammoth

They arein all ‘of the _very:
fnahionabks ahadm xmd we will’ sell .them, begmmng (u-d&y, at pri. -

‘Make no. mistake,. :it
w,ll pay VOu- u) mme ﬁftv xmles to uttend thna greut Sprmg sala.
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on \Veoidy Paymnh 5 socmﬂ‘ PmS.

anﬂt:‘:r ’

They “are hnatr{lw"f‘

i
x(.\ E 3

2y g



on.it
be.fore.-~

